
Some people believe that it is good to share as much info as possible in scientific research, 
business and the academic world. Others believe that some information is too important or too 
valuable to be shared freely. Discuss both these views and give your own opinion.

The amount of information shared in scientific research, business and the academic world is 
being highly debated these days. Some people opine that information must be shared as much 
as possible, while others argue that some information is are so invaluable that it cannot to be 
shared with no cost.

To begin with, the amount/quantity of shared information is increasing each day as the a result 
of online sharing facilities development. For instance, while a topic is searched on search 
engines like “Google” , the pages of the results appear on the screen, although they are not all 
guaranteed to be reliable sources of information. There are some authors who prefer to 
provide their gained knowledge in any fields, just to contribute to people who are studying 
science or any other academic major. 

On the other hand, there are is some registered information which are is not accessible to 
everyone. Authors of these sorts of information would rather to provide the knowledge in 
return for of money. As an example, they publish a short summary of the article, and if in case 
the reader is interested to learn more about the subject, a payment will be required. Therefore, 
not everyone would be able to access the information. Even there are some books containing 
particular information, which are hard to find and either expensive too. Some people claim that 
by avoiding sharing worthy information freely, not only is its value kept, but also the author’s 
rights and effort are is appreciated.

In conclusion, as far as I am concerned, information which is are highly valued and gathered 
during a long period of time and difficulties must not be provided with any costs. By pricing it 
them, even a little amount of money, it will be reminded to readers that it they are is not 
gained easily.


